O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1B

Calendar No.

110TH CONGRESS
L9 HLR. 1195

[Report No. 110- ]

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

Marcu 27, 2007
Received; read twice and referred to the Committee on Environment and
Public Works
JUNE (legislative day, JUNE ), 2007
Reported by Mrs. BOXER, with an amendment

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

AN ACT

To amend the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Trans-
portation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users to make tech-

nical corrections, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
TITEE —HIGHWAY PROVISIONS

N~ o o b~ W N B

RECTIONS.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1

© 00O N O O b~ w DN

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PP PR PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+ O

2
ables Wexible: Bfficient Transportation Beuity Aet: A
ables Wexible: Bfficient Transportation Beuity Aet: A
Seetion 119 of the Safe: Aeceountable; Flexible: Bffieient
Fransportation Beauity Aet: A Leoney for Hsers (9 Stat-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O M W N B O

|
|
|

3

«l Al
z

Ttem number 1 of the table contained in seetion 1302(e)
of the Sefes Aecountable; Hexible. Bfficient Transpor-

Y

2053 HY St 124557 5 aended by streddie “and

_éﬁ)_ ‘Neal%‘l%iwew‘rlw{(a%} oF I“I?% ANCR

25 Sherton—secton HH2H of the Safer Seconttables



O\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
1

for Hsers 9 State 12479 18 amended by strikine

Hhitted States Codes 1s amended by addine at the end the

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

A
)

u(qa B 6ENERAL- Al o 7 ¢ -

e
w N

N N N B B R R R e
N B O © 0 N o 0o »

N
w



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN N DN R B R R R R R R R
5E W N P O © 0 N O 0 » W N B O

S.L.C.

B)
managenent; demand management; work



O\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
6

1 i amended by redesionatine subsection o) as sabsection

2 fekx

Secttort HF of He 237 Frited States Sodes s attended—

10 St 207 after S22t Cenbrrs aned

11 4 1 stbseetton o2 H B —

12 A by stetking subsecetion b and in-

13 serting Csibsection ted s and

14 B by strikhe “SAETEAE and -

15 sertine “Sates Aeconntables Fexible, Eifieient

16 Frortsportation ftte et & Beones for Fsers

17 19 Stat 12564

© 00 N O 01 p»



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N BB O

7
) Seetion 134GH3HD) of title 23 United
before the period at the end:
PLACEMENT AND REHABHATATION":;
(B} in subseetions {h) (e} and {e} by
) in the heading to paragraph (45 of
fore “PREVENTIVE



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

8
TO4eEH T of sueh titde s amended by steikinge



O\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
9

19 ing “paragraph (H=

22 2060 Ay of titde 230 United States Codes is anended

24 (=

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

e L L i O e =
N~ O OO~ W N B O



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1

10

3 ed in the first sentenee—

yehteh S e

“I;EE;;,”,

_ nYalsil nl RFYah nl hl al )4

) Seetion 1401 of the Safe. Accountables
Flexible; Bfficient Transportation Beuity Aet: A
2) Section 1404te) of sueh Aet (19 Stat
3} Seetion T02HHBHD) of sueh Aet (9 Stat



O\ARP\ARP07944 xml S.L.C.
11

1 ) Seettonr H21200 of sueh Aet (Y Stats

2 19375 s amended—

6 tors? and insertine “raibwav-hiohway eross-

7 HresTs

9 aied

13 progratn

14 SEC. 102. MAGLEV.

15 o Fevpave—seetion HOHaHES of the Safe; Ae-

16 ecountable: Flexible: Bfficient Transportation Beauity Aet:

17 A Leenes for Heers 19 Stat: H55) 15 amnended by strtk-

18 ing subparagraphs (&) and (B) and inserting the fol-

19 jowine:

21 UBY $35:000-000 for each of fisent veats

22 200> aned 200077

24 Safes Aceonntable: Flexible: Bfficient Pransportation By-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1

© 00O N O O b~ w DN

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PR PPk PR PR
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

12
aity Aet: & Leegaey for Heers 19 Stat: 12470 1s amended
CANCE AND NATIONAL CORRIDOR INFRA-
STRUCTURE IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS:
aity: A Tegaey for Users (19 Statr 12035 15 amended
Hott of a new Anertean border plaza at the Blae Water

Iy-




O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

13



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

14
leseription and insertine “Desien- sioht-ofway: and



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PR
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+ O

15

folk and Sewth Stewx Citys meladine an nterehanoe
at Midepost 1 on T129%

brteetett of the Fhore Avente Corrtdots Bad-
Reoad to Licking Springs Read™

deseription and inserting “$400;000 to conduet Nesw



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

16
tess Park aeeess pond™—
terey Park™



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

17
work at Iitte Susitha River Aeccess road in
Attala County Distriet 4 Reads 4211 and 4204



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

18

enstneering for the reconstimetion of TH 95, freom
pavine roads; and the transfer of rail-totrnek for
the intermodal faeility at Rickenbacker Adrport; Co-
tine Toatino Quatter transit plazas at Novrnandie



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N B

N N DN DN DD P PP PR PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

19
(40} in item mumber 2035 by strildng the
o e sition:  and  eons on of
prejeet deseription and msertine “Constraet a new
project description and insertine P e



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

20
it



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

21



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
aa A WO N P O © 00 N O 0o b W N B O

22
Rottte o Fahrmann Bowdevards and a bridee eon-
the Inner Harbor™s



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

23
Rosedale Avente and constraetine a new fast Cam-
eharee
HAprovements ™
2



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

24
4456 560-0002 and insertine S58490-0002:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25
T46th St to 169 Aecess’s and

Sreieet deseriotion snd insertng “Blimination of

of Warren Road and Newbureh Road:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

26



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O M W N R O

27

ments on Hiohway 262 on the Navajo Nation in
appronehes” after “eaprerty’s



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

28
provetents o NI TOth Street/ NI Pl Perraes
provements to NI 25th Street from SR 26 Fhiver-
project deseription and tsertine “Pavine a perton



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N P O © 0 N O O A W N R O

29
east s
imrterseetion of Quiney/West Drinker/Blectrie Streets
tear the Dunmore School ecomplex™ after “roadyway
redesten’™



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+ O

30
after “rondway redesien’



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O O B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

31
Second Street 1 West Prtstons; bzerne County™s
Metpsot Steeets P Aventtes Powell Streets Jose-
Boroteh; hackawatia Connty™



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

32
eladine a projeet to establish emergeney aeeess o
preject deseription and inserting “Desion: enei ]
Frzerne Cotnty
preject deseription and inserting “Desion: enei ]
ines viohb-ofway acquisition and construetion of



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD P PP PP kPP P R
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

33
Street; or Franddin  Street {or any  combinntion



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN NDDN P PP PPk PR PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

34



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

35
tors



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R
5E W N B O © 0 N O O M W N R O

36
projeet deseription and inserting “Conduet a stady
San Geabriel
San Geabriels
San Gabriel s



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

37
Phuse HARat + of o projeet on Mhimbeth Avente w1



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O O B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

38



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+~ O

39
pont to Witkes Barre and “$1000;0002 respee-
Hyelw
ship?s



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

40



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

ristion; and econstraetton of & parking earage;
the eity of Witkes-Barre” and “$2:800;00075 respee-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD P PP PP PP PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B~ O

42

1 9y
+ ) )



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© O N O U A W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

43
improvements for development of the Wilhamsport-
and Payette Connties; AL {Crossines at CR—6; CR—
$360-060° el



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

44
Hine and eonstruetion of a bievele trail adjneent to
Projeet’:
eolamns and imsertine “PAY “Constraet 2 flyover
ramps and S Linden Street exit for access to mdus-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

45
T660 and TH FOT MNT



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

46
96



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

47
projeet deseription and isertine “Frterchanoes at I—
CSAH2 interehanse and CSAH2 corridor to TH6T
prejeet deseription and msertine “Constraet & 4lane
hishway between Maverick Junction and the Ne-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

48
ton
wretion” and insertine “on A o Gineludine
ton



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O M W N R O

49
of a bridee over Brandvwine Creek as part of the
stenalization at SR 3020 Newburg Read)/Country



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

50
sthility of a tunnel alternative to elose the 110 ree-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13

51
Recrention Aren neeess | - ineluding hill
sidde stabilization and parking ot rehabilitation atone
Dronficld Avenue™: and

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

therity made available for an item i seetion 1702 of the
wity Aet: A Leoney for Hsers (19 Stat: 1256} that is re-
dreed: by this seetion shall be made available—

thority or fandine is repealed or redueed:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

52
redueed; and

23, Hiited States Code; a State may expend for each of
for the follow

TAMBIAHED of tithe 23 Enited States Code: within
He Pepretmert of the Premse tnehine the frnd-
foreement offteers and other staff dedieated on =
Fell-time basts to partieipation i the aetivities of the
Center:

2y Pevelopment; operation; and maintenanee of
pose & tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N NN B R R R R R R R R e
W N P O © 0 N OO 00 W N B O

24

53
minak
a certiftention system by a State of any fuel sold to

a State or loeal eovernment {as defined i seetton

ment o sold to a gqualified volunteer fire department
& eertifieation system by a State of any fuel sold to
& nonprofit educational oreanization {(as defined



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

54
SEC. 106. NONMOTORIZED TRANSPORTATION PILOT PRO-
GRAM:

nesota’ =

Seetion 1908(a) of the Safe; Accountable; Flexible:
Effieient Transportation Moty et 2 Beenes for Esers
Seetion FHOHBY of the Safer Aeconmtable; Fexible:
of paragraph 9 by striking haly £ 2007 and m-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

55
$3-400;000 for fiseal vear 20045




O:\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
56

3 standine any other provision of hws the Departments

4 &) BEy AMBERICA—Seetion 1928 of the Safes Ae-

6 A Lesney for Heers (119 Stat: 1484) is amended—

8 5} as paragraphs (33 throteh (63 respectively; and

9 t2) by inserting after paragraph (B the fol-

10 Joveirre:

11 2} the enrrent appheation by the Federal

12 Hiohvway Administeation of the Buy Amerien test is

13 orly apphed o eomponents or parts of o brides

14 project and not the entive bridee project and this is

16 SEC. 110. TRANSPORTATION IMPROVEMENTS.

17 The table contained in seetion 1934} of the Safe;

18 Aceountable; Hexible: Bfficient Transportation Benity

19 et 2 Freones for Faers (9 Stats He63 5 aended—

20 ) i item namber 436 by insertine £ Saotel

21 after “Suals

22 £294 th Hetr ttrrber He by Hsertite Shy petrov-

23 ite asphalt and conerete and reinrstatline biue eob-

24 blestones? after “streets’s

25 €3} by strikine item number 451 and



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

Y

b b sridking TR e sillaes” sl e
sertine & pertod and the followine:
3) by addine at the end the followine:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5

6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

58
(4 i subseetion () fas so redestgnnted) by



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

29
and
ed—
PG i bt e b striking 506
atel
pereent’ the folowine “or; in the ease of funds
eent



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

60
tithes



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

61

2 been enacteds

3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

_éﬁ)_ E =P EYS FOR R‘Iﬂkw FARCH q yals\iava iits nISE ‘ ’f t_he

B at least $1-000.000 shall be made available
and

2} at least $4-900-000 shall be made avattable
Seetion 502 of title 23 United States Code; is
to Hifrastetetee Hvestirent teeds reports beette

aity et A feenes for Fsers (9 Stat 18293 i



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N P O © 0 N O O A W N R O

{1 reequires a nonprofit institation of higher learn-
e destenated as a Ther H university transportation

Ho—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

N NN N N N DN R R R R R R R R R
o 00 A W N PFP O © 0 N~ oo 00 M W N R O

63

for the 2dst Century (H2 Stat 257 s amended 1 Hem
SEC. 116. DEFINITION OF REPEAT INTOXICATED DRIVER
LAW.

A reeetve—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

A~ e e N <
© O N O U A~ W N B O

Y )

N N DN DN N DN
o b~ W N L O

S.L.C.
64
) a drerver’s heense suspenston for
not tess than 1+ year; or
S o ecombination of suspenston of
the prrpese of getting to and from works

" the See-



O:AARP\ARP07944 xml S.L.C.
65
3 eomes effeetive—
4 ) prbhish 1 the Federad Register a de-
6 s feededs and
7 “B) provide the pubhe with a reasonable
11 and anmaally thereafter; the Seeretary shall sabmit
12 to the Committee and Freansportation and Infrea-

13 stevetire of the Howse of Representatives and the
14 Cotmittee on the Jnvirontent and Pabhe Works of

15 the Setntte o teport on oy servers etatted hder
16 stthseettor th——

17 SEC. 119. EFFICIENT USE OF EXISTING HIGHWAY CAPAC-
18 ITY.

20 eonduet a stady on the impaets of convertine left and rieht
22 Ht Covrrves— condtetine Hie stids the See-
23 retes shal—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

66
shottders or the laek of a safety showlder i the

Congress & report on the results of the study

this Aet {other than the amendments made by see-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+~ O

67
of that et aed
Aet s of that date

seterd

TITEE H—TRANSIT PROVISIONS

B Seetton 5303GH3HD) of sueh e is
amended—
(A} by inserting Sor the identified phase?



ONARP\ARP07944 .xml S.L.C.
68

(2) Seetion 53030H2) of sueh title is amended

() SBEFION 5307 —Seetion 5307(h) of such titde is

%

() SEeroN 5309 —Section 53090m) of such title is
aetded—

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e A <
o 00 M W N B O

A e
atended—
e “Hor a eapital projeet or projeet administeative

))

N DN N N DN B P
A W N B O © 00 N



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

69
5323 HIHD) and 5333(b) of this title apphyl and

of steh Hitle 13 amended by stridkne “Mass FRANSPOR-
Py LPHHYM '&Hd : < ' “P{HH e [PB ANSPORE Tﬂéfﬂt”.

{e} SEeroN 53H—Seetion 53HHaH3) 1s amended

b strthte “seetioh 992Z3Ha P and tsertie Ssee-
Frert oo h

) SBeroN 5319 —seetion 5519 of sueh tifle is

atnended by strikine “seetton 30T and  thsertine
“seetton 30 HHHHO

B SEETON 5320—seetion 5920 of sueh #itle 18

5302 () 2 el inserting 53026
£33 stbseetion (D by tsertine “to admin-
tster this seetton and™ after “5338hH2HH " and
H by adding at the end of subseetion () the
followine:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

70

aretded by strdke Sseeton o0 27 e tserte

Ha SEErtoN 5325—eetion 5326(h) of sueh title s

amended—

Seetion 5336 of sueh tite is amended—
nhder subseetion (H2) to earty owt seetion



O\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
71

Fsers Y Stas 2995 5 aiended by strtkine
o A A —

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E WO N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

72

SHHH2 of stel et HH9 S HE i
SMea



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

73
of steh et (HY Statr 6479 18 amended by
amended—
AR
o Rieo—
presect deseription and inserting “Emy )



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN N DN R B R R R R R R R
5E W N P O © 0 N O 0 » W N B O

S.L.C.
74
IV

to Riee™;

“ N L Hter 1ol and insert-

e “hrprove trite dev-doek and—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PR PPk PR PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B~ O

S.L.C.
75

250 and S ahd Hserte Sprojects



O\ARP\ARP07944 .xml S.1.C.
76
4 eles” and inserting “hydrogen faeled vehieles™s
5 B by strikine “hyvdrogen fael ecelt em-
6 plovee shitthe vais™ atid Hsertine “hedrooen
10 Alenrtenwvr Permsvhaania™
11 Fhb =y Gb TR AERREY— 0D HE oot
13 stire of the San Gabriel Vallev—Gold Line Foothill
16 new starts ratie proeess; the Seeretary of Frans-
18 of the San Gabriel Vallev—Gold Line Foothill Jox-
19 tetstort Phase 1 oproject advateed with 100 pereent
20 not-Federal fands:
21  FIFEE HI—OTHER PROVISIONS
22 SEC. 301. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS RELATING TO MOTOR
23 CARRIER SAFETY.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

7

3 eraph {2

4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

of sueh et (119 Stat, 18993 s amended by strikinge

6461‘377'

21 peERS—Seetion 41164 of saeh Aet (119 Stat: 1728) is
24 and by



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

78
134 s amended by strikne “Heense” and thsertine “h-
censes™
A aam
Gy Reastramion  oF  Brokers—Seetion



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1

© 00 N O O b~ w DN

N N DN DN DD P PP PPk PR PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

79
tion 39 of ehapter 2 of title 18 Hnited States Code; relat-
H



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

|
%
1
'’
:
!
i?

ahy fihhe or pay any fee to a State with respeet to the
terminthe the stre of a motor earrter or motor private ear-
rier’s fleet i ealenlating the fee to be paid by a motor

e Hsertre S e



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O O B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD DN P PP P PP PR PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B~ O

81

connection with the filing of proof of finaneint re-
Seetion 43050 of the Safe; Acconntable; Klexible; 1B46-
eient Fransportation Bewity Act: & hegney for Bsers (H9
H4506H2) of title 49; United States Code; is amended
“or wnder an appheable State kaw i on Oetober 1, 2006;
the State has o form of hichway use taxation not subjeet
to eoleetion through the International Frel Tax Asree-
mept

“DREVE-AWAY SADDHEMOENE WEPH
serebeHe ottt e



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e <
w N B O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

82

ARDOUS MATERIALS TRANSPORTATION:

& PEFEHON oF Hasvar BMPRoYRRES—Seetioh

ane thsertine “elatse (1 of subparagraph (A7 and

23 H24L3) of the Safe; Aceountable; lexible; Efficient



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

83
FOUR1 s amended by fnsertine the fiest plaes it appenrs™
Foted Sttes Codes s atended by stethkine the seeton
5% of tithe 49; Hhited States Code; is amnended i the tem
fent et (49 Hoses 108 note; HS Stats 2427 15 antend-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

84
B NFsB 1HH of
3498} s amended by strikine “3657 and insertine

ot +0201 of the titde 230 Paiited States Code s amended
than three-aqrarters of 1 pereent’™



OAARP\ARPOT944 xml SL.C.
85

1 23 Seetton 200H4bH of sueh et (9 Stats

2 1529} 15 amended—

4 at the end of subparagraph s

5 B) by strikine “and’ at the end of sub-

6 paragraph (B); and

8 (3} Bffeetive Awoust 10 2005 seetion

9 HHHAHBT of tithe 257 Frtted States Coder s

10 arended by stetkene Selase G050 amed serting

11 Sebrtses H and G

12 H Seetton H of He 257 Frited Shdes Codes

14 {e); relatine to administeation expenses; and sub-

16 SEC. 304. REPEAL OF NATIONAL SURFACE TRANSPOR-

17 TATION COMMISSION.

18 Seetion 142 of the Safe: Acconntable; Hlexible: Bf-

19 ficient Transportation Bauity Aet: A Leoney for Hsers

20 HHY St F96Hs and the Hemr relatine o saeh seetion

21 i the table of contents eontatied i =eetion Bt of sueh

22 et e repetteds

23 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

24 This Act may be cited as the “Highway Technical Cor-

25 rections Act of 2007



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

86
SEC. 2. SURFACE TRANSPORTATION TECHNICAL CORREC-

TIONS.

(a) CORRECTION OF INTERNAL REFERENCES IN DIS-
ADVANTAGED — BUSINESS — ENTERPRISES.—Paragraphs
(3)(A) and (5) of section 1101(b) of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for
Users (119 Stat. 1156) are amended by striking “paragraph
(1)” each place it appears and inserting “paragraph (2)”.

(b) CORRECTION OF DISTRIBUTION OF OBLIGATION
AUTHORITY.—Section 1102(c)(5) of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for

Users (119 Stat. 1158) is amended by striking “among the

States™.
(¢) CORRECTION OF FEDERAL LANDS HIGITWAYS.—
Section 1119 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient

Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.

1190) s amended by striking subsection (m) and inserting

the following:
“(m) ForesT HIGHWAYS.—Of the amounts wmade
available for public lands highways under section 1101—

“(1) not more than $20,000,000 for each fiscal
year may be used for the maintenance of forest high-
ways;

“(2) mot more than $1,000,000 for each fiscal
year may be used for signage identifying public hunt-

g and fishing access; and



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

87
“(3) not more than $10,000,000 for each fiscal

year shall be used by the Secretary of Agriculture to

pay the costs of facilitating the passage of aquatic

species beneath forest roads (as defined in section

101(a) of title 23, Unated States Code), including the

costs of constructing, maintaining, replacing, and re-

moving culverts and bridges, as appropriate.”.

(d) CORRECTION OF DESCRIPTION OF NATIONAL COR-
RIDOR INFRASTRUCTURE IMPROVEMENT PROJECT—Item
number 1 of the table contained in section 1302(e) of the
Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Eq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1205) is amended
wn the State column by inserting “LA,” after “TX,”.

(¢) CORRECTION OF INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE SEC-
TION.—Section 1602(d)(1) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexi-
ble, Elfficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for
Users (119 Stat. 1247) is amended by striking “through 189
as sections 601 through 609, respectively” and inserting
“through 190 as sections 601 through 610, respectively”.

(f) CORRECTION OF PROJECT FEDERAL SHARE.—Sec-
tion 1964(a) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.

1519) 1s amended—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B O

88
(1) by striking “only for the States of Alaska,

Montana, Nevada, North Dakota, Oregon, and South

Dakota,”; and

(2) by striking “section 120(b)” and inserting

“section 120"
(9) TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS MANAGEMENT AND
OPERATIONS DEFINED.—Section 101(a) of title 23, United

States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(39) TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS MANAGEMENT

AND OPERATIONS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL—The term ‘transpor-
tation systems management and operations’
means an integrated program to optimize the
performance of existing infrastructure through
the implementation of multimodal and inter-
modal, cross-jurisdictional systems, services, and
projects designed to preserve capacity and im-
prove security, safety, and reliability of the
transportation system.

“(B) INCLUSIONS.—The term ‘transpor-
tation systems management and operations’ in-
cludes—

“(1) regional operations collaboration
and coordination activities between trans-

portation and public safety agencies; and



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E WO N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

89

“(11) tmprovements to the transpor-
tation system, such as traffic detection and
surveillance, arterial management, freeway
management, demand management, work
zone management, emergency management,
electronic toll collection, automated enforce-
ment, traffic incident management, road-
way weather management, traveler infor-
mation services, commercial vehicle oper-
ations, traffic control, freight management,
and coordination of highway, rail, transit,
bicycle, and pedestrian operations.”.

(h) CORRECTION OF REFERENCE IN APPORTIONMENT
OF H1GHOWAY SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM FUNDS.—
Effective October 1, 2006, section 104(b)(5)(A)(i1) of title
23, Unated States Code, is amended by striking “the Fed-
eral-avd system” each place it appears and inserting “Fed-
eral-aid highways’.

(i) CORRECTION OF AMENDMENT TO ADVANCE CON-

STRUCTION.—Section 115 of title 23, United States Code,
1s amended by redesignating subsection (d) as subsection
(c).

(j)) CORRECTION OF HIGH PRIORITY PROJECTS.—Sec-

tion 117 of title 2.3, United States Code, is amended—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e <
w N B O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

90
(1) by redesignating subsections (d) through (h)
as subsections (e) through (i), respectively;
(2) by redesignating the second subsection (c)
(relating to Federal share) as subsection (d);
(3) in subsection (a)(2)(A) by inserting “(112
Stat. 257)7 after “21st Century’; and
(4) in subsection (a)(2)(B)—
(A) by striking “subsection (b)” and insert-
g “subsection (¢)”; and
(B) by striking “SAFETEA-LU” and in-
serting “Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users
(119 Stat. 1256)”.

(k) CORRECTION OF TRANSFER OF UNUSED PROTEC-

TIVE-DEVICE FUNDS TO OTHER HIGHWAY SAFETY IM-
PROVEMENT PROGRAM PROJECTS.—Section 130(e)(2) of
title 23, United States Code, s amended by striking “pur-
poses under this subsection” and inserting “highway safety

improvement program purposes’’.

(1) METROPOLITAN TRANSPORTATION PLANNING.—

Section 134 of title 23, Unated States Code, is amended—

(1) in subsection (f)(3)(C)(11) by striking sub-
clause (II) and inserting the following:
“(II) FUNDING.—In addition to

funds made available to the metropoli-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N L O

pears; and

S.L.C.
91

tan planning organization for the Lake
Tahoe region under other provisions of
this title and chapter 53 of title 49,
prior to an allocation under section
202 of this title, the Secretary shall set
aside /> of 1 percent of funds author-
wed to be appropriated to carry out
that section, which shall be provided to
the Tahoe Metropolitan Planning Or-
ganization to carry out the transpor-
tation planning process, including the
environmental review of transportation
projects to complete environmental doc-
umentation for the Lake Tahoe region
under the Tahoe Regional Planning
Jompact as consented to in Public
Law 96-551 (94 Stat. 3233) and this

g (Y ), ”.
subparagraph.”;

(2) in subsection (j)(3)(D) by inserting “or the

vdentified phase” after “the project” each place it ap-

(3) in subsection (k)(2) by striking “a metropoli-
tan planning area serving’.

(m) CORRECTION OF HIGHWAY BRIDGE PROGRAM.—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

92

(1) IN GENERAL.—RSection 144 of title 23,

United States Code, s amended—

(A) in the section heading by striking “re-
placement and rehabilitation’;

(B) in subsections (b), (c)(1), and (e) by
striking “Federal-aid system” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “Federal-aid highway’;

(C) wn subsections (¢)(2) and (o) by striking
“the Federal-aid system” each place it appears
and inserting “Federal-aid highways”;

(D) in the heading to paragraph (4) of sub-
section (d) by inserting “SYSTEMATIC” before
“PREVENTIVE”;

(E) in subsection (e) by striking “off-system
bridges” each place it appears and inserting
“bridges not on Federal-aid highways”;

(F) by striking subsection (f);

(G) by redesignating subsections (g) through
(s) as subsections (f) through (r), respectively;

(H) in subsection (f) (as redesignated by
subparagraph (G))—

(1) n paragraph (1)(A)—
(I) i clause (vi), by inserting
except that any unobligated or unex-

pended funds remairning upon comple-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+ O

93

tion of the project under this clause
shall be transferred to and wused to
carry out the project described in
clause (viv)” after “Vermont”; and
(II) in clause (viwe), by inserting
“and corridor” after “bridge”; and
(11) n paragraph (2), by striking the
paragraph heading and inserting “BRIDGES

NOT ON FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAYS';

(I) wn subsection (m) (as redesignated by
subparagraph (G)) by striking the subsection
heading and inserting “PROGRAM FOR BRIDGES
NOT ON FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAYS”; and

(J) in subsection (n)(4)(B) (as redesignated
by subparagraph (G)) by striking “State high-
way agency”’ and inserting “State transpor-
tation department”.

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(A)  METROPOLITAN  PLANNING.—Section
104(f)(1) of title 23, United States Code, is
amended by striking “replacement and rehabili-
tation”.

(B) EQUITY BONUS PROGRAM.—Subsections
(a)(2)(C) and (b)(2)(C) of section 105 of title 23,
United States Code, are amended by striking



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

94

1 “replacement and rehabilitation” each place it
2 appears.

3 (C) ANALYSIS.—The analysis for chapter 1
4 of title 23, United States Code, is amended in
5 the item relating to section 144 by striking “‘re-
6 placement and rehabilitation”.

7 (n) CORRECTION OF NATIONAL SCENIC BYWAYS PRO-
8 GrAM COVERAGE.—Section 162 of title 23, United States
9 Code, 1s amended—
10 (1) in subsection (a)(3)(B) by striking “a Na-
11 tional Scenic Byway under subparagraph (A)” and
12 mserting “a National Scenic Byway, an All-Amer-
13 wcan Road, or one of America’s Byways under para-
14 graph (1)”; and
15 (2) wn subsection (c)(3) by striking “or All-Amer-
16 wean Road” each place it appears and inserting “All-
17 American Road, or one of America’s Byways”.
18 (0) CORRECTION OF REFERENCE IN TOLL PROVI-

19 s10N.—Section 166(D)(5)(C) of title 23, United States Code,
20 is amended by striking “paragraph (3)” and inserting
21 “paragraph (4)”.

22 (p) CORRECTION OF RECREATIONAL TRAILS PROGRAM
23 APPORTIONMENT KEXCEPTIONS.—Section 206(d)(3)(4) of
24 title 23, Unated States Code, s amended by striking “(B),
25 (0), and (D)” and inserting “(B) and (C)”.



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

95
(q) CORRECTION OF INFRASTRUCTURE FINANCE.—
Section 601(a)(3) of title 23, United States Code, s amend-
ed by inserting “bbb minus, BBB (low),” after “Baa3,”.
(r) CORRECTION OF MISCELLANEOUS TYPOGRAPHICAL
ERRORS.—
(1) Section 1401 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexi-
ble, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy
Jor Users (119 Stat. 1226) 1is amended by redesig-
nating subsections (d) and (e) as subsections (¢) and
(d), respectively.
(2) Section 1404(e) of such Act (119 Stat. 1229)
1s amended by inserting “tribal,” after “local,”.
(3) Section 10211(b)(2) of such Act (119 Stat.
1937) 1s amended by striking “plan administer” and
mserting “plan and administer”.
(4) Section 10212(a) of such Act (119 Stat.
1937) is amended—

(A) by mserting “equity bonus,” after
“minimum guarantee,”;

(B) by striking ‘‘freight intermodal connec-
tors” and inserting “railway-highway cross-
mgs’’;

(C) by striking “high risk rural road,”; and

(D) by wnserting after “highway safety vm-

provement programs” the following: “(and sepa-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N B R R R R R R R R
P O © W N O O M W N B O

96

rately the set aside for the high risk rural road
program,)”.
SEC. 3. MAGLEYV.

(a) FUNDING.—Section 1101(a)(18) of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1155) 1s amended by striking
subparagraphs (A) and (B) and inserting the following:

“(A) $20,000,000 for fiscal year 2007; and
“(B) $35,000,000 for each of fiscal years
2008 and 2009.”.

(b) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Section 1307 of the Safe,
Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act:
A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1217) is amended by adding
at the end the following:

“(e) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Funds authorized under
section 1101(a)(18) shall be available for obligation in the
same manner as if the funds were apportioned under chap-
ter 1 of title 23, United States Code; except that the funds
shall not be transferable and shall remain available until
expended, and the Federal share of the cost of a project to

be carried out with such funds shall be 80 percent.”.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

97
SEC. 4. PROJECTS OF NATIONAL AND REGIONAL SIGNIFI-

CANCE.
The table contained in section 1301 (m) of the Safe, Ac-

countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A

1

2

3

4

S Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1203) is amended—
6 (1) wn ttem number 19 by striking the project de-
7 seription and inserting “Regional rail expansion and
8 transportation infrastructure in the vicinity of Santa
9

Teresa, New Mexico”: and
D )

10 (2) in ttem number 22 by striking the project de-
11 seription and inserting “Redesign and reconstruction
12 of interchanges 298 and 299 of I-80 and accom-
13 panying vmprovements to any other public roads in
14 the vicinaty, Monroe County”.

15 SEC. 5. IDLING REDUCTION FACILITIES.

16 Section 111 of title 2.3, United States Code, 1s amended
17 by striking subsection (d).

18 SEC. 6. PROJECT AUTHORIZATIONS.

19 (a) IN GENERAL—The table contained in section 1702
20 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation
21 Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1256) is amend-
22 ed—

23 (1) in item number 3688 by striking “road” and
24 mserting “trail”;
25 (2) in item number 3691 by striking the project

26 description and inserting “Hoonah roads”;



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

98

(3) an item number 3695 by striking “in
Soldotna” and inserting “in the Kenai River cor-
ridor’;

(4) wn item number 3699 by striking “to improve
fish habitat™;

(5) in item number 3700 by inserting “and ferry
Sfacilities” after “a ferry”;

(6) in item number 3703 by inserting “or other
roads” after “Cape Blossom Road’;

(7) an atem number 3704 by striking “Fair-
banks” and inserting “Alaska Highway™;

(8) in item number 3705 by striking “in Cook
Inlet for the Westside development/Williamsport-Pile
Bay Road” and inserting “for development of the
Williamsport-Pile Bay Road corridor’;

(9) an atem  number 3828 by  striking
“$2,000,000” and inserting “$11,000,000;

(10) by striking item number 3829;

(11) by striking item number 3832;

(12) in item number 3861 by striking the project
description and inserting “Creation of a greenway
path along the Naugatuck River in Waterbury’;

(13) in item number 3883 by striking the project
description and inserting “Wilmington Riverfront Ac-

cess and Street Grid Redesign™;



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

99

(14) in item number 3892 by striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$8,800,000”;

(15) an  atem number 3894 by striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$1,200,0007;

(16) in item nwmber 3909 by striking the project
description and inserting “S.R. 281, the Avalon Bou-
levard Expansion Project from Interstate 10 to U.S.
Highway 917

(17) in item number 3911 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct a new bridge at
Indian Street, Martin County’;

(18) in item number 3916 by striking the project
description and inserting “City of Hollywood for U.S.
1/Federal Highway, north of Young Circle”;

(19) in item number 3937 by striking the project
description and inserting “Kingsland bypass from CR
61 to 1-95, Camden County’;

(20) in item number 3945 by striking “CR 293
to CS 52317 and inserting “SR 371 to SR 400”;

(21) in item number 3965 by striking “transpor-
tation projects” and inserting “and air quality
projects’;

(22) in item number 3986 by striking the project
description and inserting “Extension of Sugarloaf

Parkway, Gwinnett County’;



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

100

>

(23) in item number 3999 by striking “Bridges’
and inserting “Bridge and Corridor”;

(24) in item number 4003 by striking the project
description and inserting “City of Council Bluffs and
Pottawattamie County FEast Beltway Roadway and
Connectors Project’;

(25) in item number 4043 by striking “MP 9.3,
Segment I, II, and III” and inserting “Milepost
24.37;

(26) in item number 4050 by striking the project
description and inserting “Preconstruction and con-
struction activities of U.S. 51 between the Assumption
Bypass and Vandalia™;

(27) in item nwmber 4058 by striking the project
description and inserting “For improvements to the
road between Brighton and Bunker Hill in Macoupin
County’;

(28) in item numbers 4062 and 4084 by striking
the project descriptions and mserting
“Preconstruction, construction, and related research
and studies of 1-290 Cap the Ike project in the village
of Oak Park”;

(29) in item number 4089 by inserting “and

parking facility/entrance improvements serving the



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PP PP PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

101

Museum of Science and Industry” after “Lakeshore
Drive”;

(30) in item number 4103 by inserting “and ad-
jacent to the” before “Shawnee”;

(31) in item nwmber 4110 by striking the project
description and inserting “For improvements to the
road between Brighton and Bunker Hill in Macoupin
County’;

(32) in item number 4120 by striking the project
description and amount and inserting “Upgrade
146th ~ Street  to  Improve 1-69  Access” and
“$800,0007, respectively;

(33) in atem number 4125 by  striking
“$250,000” and inserting “$1,650,000”;

(34) by striking item number 4170;

(35) by striking item number 4179;

(36) in item nwmber 4185 by striking the project
description and inserting “Replace the Clinton Street
Bridge spanning St. Mary’s River in downtown Fort
Wayne’;

(37) in item number 4299 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improve U.S. 40, MD 715
interchange and other roadways in the vicinity of Ab-
erdeen  Proving Ground to support BRAC-related
growth’;



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

102

(38) in item number 4313 by striking “Mary-
land Avenue” and all that follows through “Rd. cor-
ridor” and inserting “intermodal access and pedes-
trian safety tmprovements”;

(39) in atem  number 4315 by  striking
“stormwater matigation project” and inserting “envi-
ronmental preservation project”;

(40) in item nwmber 4318 by striking the project
description and inserting “Planning, design, and con-
struction of improvements to the highway systems
connecting to Lewiston and Auburn downtowns”;

(41) in item number 4323 by striking the project
description and inserting “MaineDOT Acadia inter-
modal passenger and maintenance facility’;

(42) in item number 4338 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct 1 or more grade-
separated crossings of =75, and make associated 1m-
provements to improve local and regional east-west
mobility between Mileposts 279 and 2827

(43) in item number 4355 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, engineering, ROW
acquisition, construction, and construction engineer-
g for the reconstruction of TH 95, from 12th Ave-

nue to CSAH 13, including bridge and approaches,



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PP PP PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

103
ramps, intersecting roadways, signals, turn lanes,
and multiuse trail, North Branch’;

(44) in item number 4357 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, construct, ROW,
and expand TH 241 and CSAH 35 and associated
streets in the City of St. Michael’;

(45) in item number 4360 by striking the project
description and inserting “Planning, design, and con-
struction for Twin Cities Bioscience Corridor in St.
Paul’;

(46) in item nwmber 4362 by striking the project
description and inserting “I-494/U.S. 169 inter-
change reconstruction including U.S. 169/Valley View
Road interchange, Twin Cities Metropolitan Area’;

(47) in item number 4365 by striking the project
description and inserting “34th Street realignment
and 34th Street and 1-94 interchange, including re-
tention and reconstruction of the SE Main Avenue/
CSAH 52 interchange ramps at 1-94, and other
transportation vmprovements for the city of Moor-
head, including the SE Main Avenue GSI and Moor-
head Comprehensive Rail Safety Program”;

(48) in item number 4369 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction of S8th Street

North, Stearns C.R. 120 to TH 15 in St. Cloud”;



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

104

(49) in item number 4371 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction and ROW of
TH 241, CSAH 35 and associated streets in the City
of St. Michael”;

(50) in atem number 4411 by  striking
“Southaven™ and inserting “DeSoto County’;

(51) in item number 4424 by striking the project
description and inserting “U.S. 93 Kvaro to Polson
transportation improvement projects”;

(52) in item number 4428 by striking the project
description and inserting “US 76 improvements’;

(53) in item number 4457 by striking the project
description and nserting “Construct an interchange
at an existing grade separation at SR 1602 (Old
Stantonsburg Rd.) and U.S. 264 Bypass in Wilson
Jounty”’;

(54) in item number 4461 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation and re-
lated improvements at Queens Unaversity of Char-
lotte, including the Queens Science Center and the
Marion Diehl Center, Charlotte”;

(55) in item number 4507 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, right-of-way and

construction of Highway 35 between Norfollk and



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
E W N B O © 0 N O U0 A W N R O

105
South Svoux City, including an interchange at mile-
post 1 on U.S. 1-1297;

(56) in item number 4555 by inserting “Canal
Street and” after “Reconstruction of”;

(57) in item nwmber 4565 by striking the project
description and inserting “Railroad Construction and
Acquisition, Ely and White Pine County’;

(58) in item number 4588 by inserting “Private
Parking and” before “Transportation”;

(59) in item number 4596 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation center,
Corning’;

(60) in item number 4610, by striking the
project description and inserting “‘Demolition, site
restoration, and hazardous wmaterial abatement of
Alert Facility at Plattsburgh International Avrport”;

(61) in item number 4649 by striking the project
description and inserting “Fairfield County, OH
U.S. 33 and old U.S. 33 safety improvements and re-
lated construction, city of Lancaster and surrounding
areas’’;

(62) in item number 4651 by striking “for the
transfer of rail to truck for the intermodal” and in-

serting “, and construction of an intermodal freight”;



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

106

(63) in item number 4691 by striking the project
description and inserting “Transportation improve-
ments to Idabel Industrial Park Rail Spur, Idabel”;

(64) in item number 4722 by striking the project
description and inserting “Highway, traffic, pedes-
trian, and rwerfront improvements, Pittsburgh’;

(65) in item number 4749 by striking “study”
and inserting “improvements’;

(66) in item number 4821 by striking “highway
grade crossing project, Clearfield and Clinton Coun-
ties” and inserting “Project for highway grade cross-
mgs and other purposes relating to the Project in
Jambria, Centre, Clearfield, Clinton, Indiana, and
Jefferson Counties™;

(67) in item number 4838 by striking “study”
and inserting “tmprovements”’;

(68) in item number 4839 by striking ‘fuel-
celled” and inserting “fueled”;

(69) in item number 4866 by  striking
“$11,000,000” and inserting “$9,400,000”’;

(70) by inserting after item number 4866 the fol-

lowing:

“4866A RI | Repavr and restore rail- $1,600,0007;

road bridge in Westerly



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

107

(71) in item number 4892 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construct a 4-lane high-
way between maverick Junction and the Nebraska
border”;

(72) in item nwmber 4915 by striking the project
description and inserting “For projects of highest pri-
ority, as determined by the South Dakota DOT”;

(73) an  atem  number 4916 by  striking
“$1,000,000” and inserting “$328,000”:

(74) in atem number 4924 by  striking
“$3,450,000” and inserting “$4,122,000”;

(75) in item number 4927 by striking the project
description and inserting “Construction and Im-
provements to the College Street Corridor, Great
Smoky Mountain Heritage Highway Cultural and
Visitors Center in Maryville”;

(76) in item number 4960 by inserting “of which
$50,000 shall be used for a street paving project, Cal-
houn™ after “County”;

(77) in item number 4974 by striking ©, Sevier
County’;

(78) in item number 5008 by inserting “/Kane

Creek Boulevard” after <500 West”:
9 )



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

108

(79) in ttem numbers 5011 and 5033 by striking
“200 South Interchange” each place it appears and
wmserting “400 South Interchange’;

(80) in item number 5021, by striking “Pine
View Dam,”;

(81) in tem number 5026 by striking the project
description and inserting “Roadway improvements
on Washington Fields Road/300 East, Washington™;

(82) in item number 5027 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “safety project”;

113

(83) in item number 5028 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “lighting’’;

(84) in item number 5029 by inserting “and
roadway improvements” after “lights”;

(85) in number 5032 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Expand Redhills Parkway,
St. George™;

(86) in item number 5132 by striking the project
description and inserting “St. Croix River crossing
project, Wisconsin State Highway 64, St. Croix
County, Wisconsin, to Minnesota State Highway 36,
Washington County”; and

(87) in item number 5161 by striking the project
description and inserting “Raleigh Street Extension

Project tn Martinsburg”.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

109

(b) TRANSFER OF PROJECT FUNDS.—The Secretary of
Transportation shall transfer to the Commandant of the
Coast Guard amounts made available to carry out the
project described in vtem number 4985 of the table contained
wm section 1702 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient
Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat.
1447) to carry out that project, in accordance with the Act
of June 21, 1940 (commonly known as the “Truman-Hobbs
Act”) (33 U.S.C. 511 et seq.).

(¢) UNUSED OBLIGATION AUTHORITY.—Notwith-
standing any other provision of law, unused obligation au-
thority made available for an item in section 1702 of the
Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Kq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1256) that 1is re-
pealed, or authorized funding for such an item that is re-
duced, by this section shall be made available—

(1) for an item in section 1702 of that Act that

18 added or increased by this section and that is in

the same State as the item for which obligation au-

thority or funding is repealed or reduced;
(2) in an amount proportional to the amount of
obligation authority or funding that is so repealed or

reduced; and



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

110
(3) individually for projects numbered 1 through
3676 pursuant to section 1102(c)(4)(A) of that Act
(119 Stat. 1158).

(d) ADDITIONAL DISCRETIONARY USE OF SURFACE

TRANSPORTATION PROGRAM FUNDS.—Of the funds appor-
tioned to each State under section 104(b)(3) of title 23,
Unated States Code, a State may expend for each of fiscal
years 2007 through 2009 not more than $1,000,000 for the

Jollowing activities:

(1) Participation in the Joint Operation Center

Jor Fuel Compliance established —under —section

143(b)(4)(H) of title 23, Unated States Code, within
the Department of the Treasury, including the fund-
mg of additional positions for motor fuel tax enforce-
ment officers and other staff dedicated on a full-time
basis to participation wn the activities of the Center.

(2) Development, operation, and maintenance of
electronic filing systems to coordinate data exchange
with the Internal Revenue Service by States that im-
pose a tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any
refinery and on the removal of taxable fuel from any
terminal.

(3) Development, operation, and maintenance of
electronic single point of filing in conjunction with

the Internal Revenue Service by States that 1mpose a



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PP PP PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O 0O b W N B+~ O

111
tax on the removal of taxable fuel from any refinery
and on the removal of taxable fuel from any terminal.
(4) Development, operation, and maintenance of

a certification system by a State of any fuel sold to

a State or local government (as defined in section

4221(d)(4) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986) for

the exclusive use of the State or local government or

sold to a qualified volunteer fire department (as de-

Jined in section 150(e)(2) of such Code) for its exclu-

sive use.

(5) Development, operation, and maintenance of

a certification system by a State of any fuel sold to

a nonprofit educational organization (as defined in

section  4221(d)(5) of such Code) that includes

verification of the good standing of the organization

i the State in which the organization is providing

educational services.

SEC. 7. CORRECTION OF INTERSTATE DESIGNATION.

(a) TREATMENT.—Section 1908(a) of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1469) 1s amended by striking
paragraph (3).

(b) NATIONAL HIGHWAY SYSTEM.—Section 1908(b) of
the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation
Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1470) 1is amend-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

112

ed by striking “from the Arkansas State line” and inserting

“from Interstate Route 5407

SEC. 8. FUTURE OF SURFACE TRANSPORTATION SYSTEM.
Section 1909(b) of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-

cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119

Stat. 1471) s amended—

(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (4) of
paragraph (9) by striking “July 1, 2007” and insert-
g “December 31, 2007";

(2) wn paragraph (11)(C) by striking “the Ad-
manistrator of the Federal Highway Admanistration”
and nserting “the Secretary’;

(3) wn paragraph (11)(D)(i) by striking “, on a
revmbursable basis,”;

(4) in paragraph (15) by striking “$1,400,000
Jor each of fiscal years 2006 and 2007” and inserting
“$1,400,000 for fiscal year 2006 and $3,400,000 for
fiscal year 20077;

(5) by redesignating paragraphs (14), (15), (16),
and (17) as paragraphs (15), (16), (17), and (18), re-
spectively; and

(6) by inserting after paragraph (13) the fol-
lowing:

“(14) LIMITATIONS.—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R
5E WO N B O © 0 N O O A W N L O

113

“(A) FUNDS.—Funds made avarlable to
carry out this section may be expended only to
support the activities of the Commission.

“(B) DATA, ANALYSES, AND REPORTS.—No
data, analysis, report, or other docwment pre-
pared for the Commaission to fulfill the duties of
the Commission may be provided to, or shared
with, any other commassion or task force until
the data, analysis, report, or document has been
made available to the public.”.

SEC. 9. BUDGET JUSTIFICATION.

Section 1926 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (49
U.S.C. 301 note; 119 Stat. 1483) is amended by striking
“The Department” and inserting “Notwithstanding any
other provision of law, the Department”.

SEC. 10. BUY AMERICA.

Section 1928 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (119
Stat. 1484) s amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (2) through (5)
as paragraphs (3) through (6), respectively; and
(2) by inserting after paragraph (1) the fol-

lowing:



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

114
“(2) the current application by the Federal
Highway Administration of the Buy America test as
applied only to components or parts of a bridge
project and mnot the entire bridge project is incon-

sistent with this sense of Congress;”.

SEC. 11. TRANSPORTATION IMPROVEMENTS.

The table contained in section 1934(c) of the Safe, Ac-

countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A

Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1486) is amended—

(1) in atem number 12 by striking “Yukon
River” and inserting “Kuskokwim River”;

(2) in item number 18 by striking “Engineering
and Construction in Merced County” and inserting
“and safety improvements/realignment of SR 165
project study report and environmental studies in
Merced and Stanislaus Counties”;

(3) in ttem number 38 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Relocation of the Newark
Train Station”;

(4) wn ttem number 57 by striking the project de-
seription and inserting “Kingsland bypass from CR
61 to 1-95, Camden County”;

(5) in item number 114—

(A) by striking “IA-327; and
(B) by wnserting “SW after “Construct”;



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

115

(6) in ttem number 122 by striking the project
description and inserting “Design, right-of-way, and
construction of the SW Arterial and connections to
U.S. 20, Dubuque County’;

(7) in item number 130 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improvements and reha-
Dilitation to rail and bridges on the Appanoose Coun-
ty Community Railroad”;

(8) in item number 133 by striking “IA-327;

(9) in ttem number 138 by striking the project
description and inserting “West Spencer Beltway
Project”;

(10) in item number 142 by striking “MP 9.3,
Segment I, II, and III” and inserting “Milepost
24.37;

(11) wn item number 161 by striking “Bridge re-
placement on Johnson Drive and Nall Ave.” and in-
serting “Construction improvements’;

(12) in item number 182 by striking the project
description and inserting “Improve U.S. 40, M.D.
715 anterchange, and other roadways in the vicinity
of Aberdeen Proving Ground to support BRAC-related
growth’;

(13) in item number 198 by striking the project

description and inserting “Construct 1 or more grade



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PP PP PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

116

separated crossings of 1-75 and make associated 1m-
provements to 1mprove local and regional east-west
mobility between Mileposts 279 and 2827

(14) in item number 201 by striking the project
description and inserting “Alger County, paving a
portion of H-58 from Buck Hill to a point located
4,000 feet east of the Hurricane River”;

(15) in item number 238 by striking the project
description and inserting “Develop and construct the
St. Mary water project road and bridge infrastruc-
ture, including a new bridge and approaches across
St. Mary Riwver, stabilization and improvements to
Unated States Route 89, and road/canal from Siphon
Bridge to Spider Lake, on the condition that
$2,500,000 of the amount made available to carry out
this item may be made available to the Bureauw of
Reclamation for use for the Swift Current Creek and
Boulder Creek bank and bed stabilization project in
the Lower St. Mary Lake drainage’;

(16) in item number 329 by inserting *, Tulsa™
after “technology’;

(17) an atem number 358 by striking fuel-
celled” and inserting “fueled’;

(18) in item number 374 by striking the project

description and inserting “Construct a 4-lane high-



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD P PP PP PP PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

117

way between Maverick Junction and the Nebraska

border”; and

(19) in item number 402 by striking ‘‘from 2 to
5 lanes and vmprove alignment within rights-of-way
i St. George” and inserting “, St. George”.

SEC. 12. HIGHWAY RESEARCH FUNDING.

(a) F-SHRP FUNDING.—Notwithstanding any other
provision of law, for each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009,
at any time at which an apportionment is made of the sums
authorized to be appropriated for the surface transportation
program, the congestion matigation and avr quality im-
provement program, the National Highway System, the
Interstate maintenance program, the bridge program, or the
highway safety improvement program, the Secretary of
Transportation shall—

(1) deduct from each apportionment an amount
not to exceed 0.205 percent of the apportionment; and

(2) transfer or otherwise make that amount
available to carry out section 510 of title 23, Unated
States Code.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) FUNDING.—Section 5101 of the Safe, Ac-
countable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity
Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1779) is amend-
ed—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N B O

118
(A) in subsection (a)(1) by striking “509,

and 5107 and inserting “and 5097;

(B) in subsection (a)(4) by striking

“$69,700,000” and all that follows through

“2009” and inserting “$40,400,000 for fiscal

year 2005, $69,700,000 for fiscal year 20006,

$76,400,000 for each of fiscal years 2007 and

2008, and $78,900,000 for fiscal year 2009”; and

(C) wn subsection (b) by inserting “or, in

the case of funds appropriated by subsection (a)

to carry out section 5201, 5202, or 5203, 80 per-

cent” after “50 percent”.

(2) FUTURE STRATEGIC HIGHWAY RESEARCH
PROGRAM.—Section 5210 of the Safe, Accountable,
Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A Leg-
acy for Users (119 Stat. 1804) s amended—

(A) by striking subsection (c); and
(B) by redesignating subsection (d) as sub-

section (c).

(¢) CONTRACT AUTHORITY.—Funds made avarlable
under this section shall be available for obligation in the
same manner as if the funds were apportioned under chap-
ter 1 of title 23, Unated States Code, except that the Federal

share shall be determined under section 510(f) of that title.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

119

(d) APPLICABILITY OF OBLIGATION LIMITATION.—
Funds made available under this section shall be subject
to any limatation on obligations for Federal-avd highways
and highway safety construction programs under section
1102 the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transpor-
tation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (23 U.S.C. 104 note;
119 Stat. 1157) or any other Act.

(e) EQuITY BONUS FORMULA.—Notwithstanding any
other provision of law, n allocating funds for the equity
bonus program under section 105 of title 2.3, United States
Code, for each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009, the Sec-
retary of Transportation shall make the requived calcula-

trons under that section as if this section had not been en-

acted.
(f) FUNDING FOR RESEARCH ACTIVITIES.—Of the
amount made available by section 5101(a)(1) of the Safe,

Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act:
A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1779)—
(1) at least $1,000,000 shall be made available
Jor each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009 to carry
out section 502(h) of title 23, United States Code; and
(2) at least $4,900,000 shall be made available
Jor each of fiscal years 2007 through 2009 to carry
out section 502(v) of that title.

(9) TECHINICAL AMENDMENTS.—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

120

(1) SURFACE TRANSPORTATION RESEARCI.—
Section 502 of title 23, United States Code, is amend-
ed by striking the first subsection (h), relating to in-
frastructure mmvestment needs reports beginning with
the report for January 31, 1999.

(2) ADVANCED TRAVEL FORECASTING PROCE-
DURES PROGRAM.—Section 5512(a)(2) of the Safe,
Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Fq-
wity Act: A Legacy for Users (119 Stat. 1829) 1is
amended by striking “PROGRAM APPRECIATION.—"
and inserting “PROGRAM APPLICATION.—.

(3) UNIVERSITY TRANSPORTATION RESEARCH.—
Section 5506 of title 49, United States Code, s
amended—

(A) in subsection (1)—
(1) by striking “In order to” and in-
serting the following:

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In order to”; and

(11) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) SpECIAL RULE.—Nothing in paragraph (1)
requires a nonprofit institution of higher learning
designated as a Tier II university transportation cen-
ter to mawntain total expenditures as described in
paragraph (1) in excess of the amount of the grant

awarded to the institution.”; and



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD P PP PP PR PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

121

(B) in subsection (k)(3) by striking “The
Secretary” and all that follows through “to carry
out this section” and inserting “For each of fis-
cal years 2007 through 2009, the Secretary shall
expend not more than 1.5 percent of amounts
made available to carry out this section’.

SEC. 13. RESCISSION.

Section 10212 of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Kffi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (as
amended by section 1302 of the Pension Protection Act of
2006 (Public Law 109-280)) (119 Stat. 1937; 120 Stat.
780) 1is amended by striking “$8,593,000,000” each place
it appears and inserting “$8,710,000,000”.

SEC. 14. TEA-21 TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—RSection 1108(f)(1) of the Transpor-
tation Equity Act for the 21st Century (23 U.S.C. 133 note;
112 Stat. 141) is amended by striking “2003” and inserting
“2009”.

(b) BEArTOOTH HIGHWAY, WYOMING AND MON-
TANA.—Item number 1646 of the table contained in section
1602 of the Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century
(112 Stat. 317) is amended in the project description by
striking “and construction” and inserting “reconstruction,
maintenance (including routine and preventive mainte-

nance), snow removal, and pavement preservation”.



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

122

1 SEC. 15. HIGH PRIORITY CORRIDOR AND INNOVATIVE

2
3

PROJECT TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

(a) HicrH PRIORITY CORRIDORS.—Section 1105(c) of

4 the Intermodal Surface Transportation Efficiency Act of

© 00 N o O,

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

1991 (105 Stat. 2032; 119 Stat. 1212) 1s amended—

(1) i paragraph (63) by striking “and Unaited
States Routes 1, 3, 9, 17, and 46,” and inserting
“Unated States Routes 1, 9, and 46, and State Routes
3and 17,”; and

(2) in paragraph (64)—

(A) by striking “United States Route 427
and inserting “State Route 427; and

(B) by striking “Interstate Route 676 and
mserting “Interstate Routes 76 and 6767

(b) INNOVATIVE PROJECTS.—The table contained in

section 1107(b) of the Intermodal Surface Transportation
Efficiency Act of 1991 (105 Stat. 2048(b)) is amended in
item number 89, in the matter under the column with the
heading “INNOVATIVE PROJECTS”, by inserting “and con-
tiguous counties” after “Michigan”.

SEC. 16. DEFINITION OF REPEAT INTOXICATED DRIVER

LAW.

Section 164(a)(5) of title 23, Unated States Code, s

amended by striking subparagraphs (A) and (B) and in-
serting the following:

“(A) receive—



O:\ARP\ARP(07944 .xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e <
w N B O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

123

“(0) a drwver’s license suspension for
not less than 1 year; or

“(11) a combination of suspension of all
driving privileges for the first 45 days of
the suspension period followed by a rein-
statement of Limited driving privileges for
the purpose of getting to and from work,
school, or an alcohol treatment program if
an gnition interlock device is installed on
each of the motor wvehicles owned or oper-
ated, or both, by the individual;

“(B) be subject to the impoundment or im-
mobilization of, or the installation of an ignition
wnterlock system on, each motor vehicle owned or
operated (or both) by the individual;”.

SEC. 17. RESEARCH TECHNICAL CORRECTION.

Section 5506(e)(5)(C) of title 49, Unated States Code,
1s  amended by  striking  “$2,225,000"and  inserting
“$9 950,000,

SEC. 18. EFFECTIVE DATE.

(a) IN GENERAL—ZExcept as otherwise provided in
this Act (tncluding subsection (b)), this Act and the amend-
ments made by this Act take effect on the date of enactment
of this Act.

(b) EXCEPTION.—



O:\ARP\ARP07944.xml S.L.C.

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17

124

(1) IN GENERAL—The amendments made by
this Act (other than the amendments made by sections
4, 6, and 11) to the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Effi-
cient Transportation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users
(Public Law 109-59; 119 Stat. 1144) shall—

(A) take effect as of the date of enactment
of that Act; and

(B) be treated as being included in that Act
as of that date.

(2) EFFECT OF AMENDMENTS.—HKach provision
of the Safe, Accountable, Flexible, Efficient Transpor-
tation Equity Act: A Legacy for Users (Public Law
109-59; 119 Stat. 1144) (including the amendments
made by that Act) (as in effect on the day before the
date of enactment of this Act) that 1s amended by this
Act (other than sections 4, 6, and 11) shall be treated

as not being enacted.



